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Mr. Chairperson: G oo d  morni ng. Will  the 
Standing Committee on Public Utilities and 
Natural Resources please come to order. This 
morning the committee will be considering the 
March 31, 1993, Annual Report of the Manitoba 
liquor Control Commission. 

Did the minister responsible have an opening 
statement and would he please introduce the 
representatives present from MLCC? 

Bon. Harold Gilleshammer (Minister charged 
with the administration of The Liquor Control 
Act): Mr. Chairperson,  m y  brief opening 
statement will be to introduce the people with me 
today. I am very pleased to have with me the new 
Chairman of the MLCC, Mr. Grant Holmes, who 
assumed these duties a few weeks ago, and I have 

invited him along today to listen in and get a better 
understanding of how this committee works in 
relationship to the Liquor Control Commission. 
And, of course, Derek Smith, the CEO ofMLCC is 
not a stranger to this committee and I think known 
to all members here. 

So we are very pleased today to present the 70th 
Annual Report for the fiscal year April 1, 1992, to 
March 31, 1993, and I will leave my comments at 
that. 

Mr. Chairperson: We thank the minister. Does 
the critic from the official opposition party, Mr. 
Storie, have an opening statement? 

Mr. Jerry Storie (Fiin Flon): Mr. Chairperson, 
my comments are going to be equally brief. I am 
obviously interested in the performance of the 
commission over the last year, but there are a 
couple of other items that perhaps are of more 
interest, I meant financial performance over the 
last few years. But a couple of other policy areas 
that I am interested in and want to discuss with the 
minister and perhaps the chairperson of the board 
specifically relating to the legislation that was 
amended last year, particularly the sections dealing 
with notification to customers of the potential 
dangers of consumption of alcohol. 

Some members of the committee may not have 
been involved in that debate, but I had proposed 
that  the Liquor Commission take o n  the 
responsibility of putting warning labels on alcohol 
containers, with the exception of individual cans of 
beer, but we finally agreed, essentially because we 
in the opposition had no choice, to an amendment 
that I think was much watered down. I was given 
assurances, and it is part of the record of July 26, 
1993, that the commission would make some 
e f f o r t  to l ive up to its perhaps weakened 
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obligations, but obligations nonetheless in tenns of 
warning labels. So I want to discuss that for a 
period of time. 

The last time this committee met, we also spent 
some time discussing the impact of the new wine 
boutiques and the impact particularly on the efforts 
of the commission over a number of years to 
improve the selection of wines that they offer as 
well as the money, the taxpayers' money, that had 
been spent on developing staff to assist in the • 

selection of wines and to perhaps offer more 
.. customer setvice" in that area. So those are two 
areas I think we are going to deal with as well as 
the financial aspects of this report, Mr. 
Chairperson. 

Mr. Chairperson: We thank the member. Did the 
critic from the second opposition party, Mr. 
Kowalski, have an opening statement? 

Mr. Gary Kowalski (The Maples): Yes, my 
comments will be briefer as my very first 
committee meeting as an MLA. This will be a 
learning experience, how a committee operates, 
and I am looking forward to it. 

My contact with the Liquor Commission as a 
police officer 20 years or something, you have 
effects from the use of the product. The areas 
where I will be interested in hearing or asking 
questions about is in regard to any plans for 
privatization of liquor sales in Manitoba. Also, I 
have some questions about microbreweries and 
sale of microbrewery products. So I will be 
interested in hearing about that. Thank you. 

Mr. Chairperson: How did the committee wish to 
proceed this morning with the report? Shall the 
annual report be considered in its entirety? 

Floor Comment: Entirety. 

Mr. Chairperson: In its entirety? It is agreed. 
Any questions? 

Mr. Storie: Well, perhaps we could hear from the 
CEO or the chairperson of the board, generally, on 
the financial }lerfonnance. Obviously, over the last 
number of years, we have seen a reduction in the 
overall revenue being transferred to government. I 
am just wondering what the situation is this year, 
and is there any specific way of accounting for the 

current circumstances? What are other liquor 
commissions experiencing and what does the 
future hold for the Manitoba Liquor Commission 
in tenns of revenue? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I will turn that over to Mr. 
Smith to answer, but before I do will just 
acknowledge that certainly there have been 
tremendous efforts on the part of the commission 
and departments o f  government to make 
customers, citizens aware of many of the 
downsides of drinking and driving. Practices out 
there have changed whereby some of the practices 
of citizens, in tenns of accessing establishments, 
have changed. It has affected sales and patterns 
have changed, but by and large the commission is 
still doing very well. I will maybe just ask the 
president to comment in more detail on that. 

Mr. Derek S mith (Pres iden t and Chief 
Executive Officer): Of course, dealing with the 
annual report for the year ended March 31, 1993, 
we could see that there was a slight decline in sales 
and a slight decline in profit, primarily because of 
the cool summer that we had during that year 
which affected beer sales. Nevertheless there is 
less consumption of beverage alcohol because of 
lifestyles and health styles and other good reasons 
why people should be drinking less. 

As for the year ended March 31, 1994, our 
financial numbers are presently being audited, but 
we can tell you the sales and profits are 
approximately the same as what they were last 
year. What we tried to do is enhance the sale of 
beverage alcohol in a socially responsible way, 
including better merchandising and sales and to try 
to sell wine in particular in a more appropriate 
fashion as a professional retailer. 

Mr. Storie: I guess just another specific question 
on the financial picture. One of the things that has 
certainly increased over the last four years is the 
General and Administrative costs, about 12 
percent. I am wondering generally, if we are 
selling less liquor, why is that occurring? 

Mr. Smith: The General and Administrative 
Expenses have in fact been reducing if we look at 
absolute numbers. The increases have been 
primarily as a result of salary increases as a result 



May31, 1994 LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF MANITOBA 74 

of the contracts we have with our employees, but if 
you look at the numbeiS earlier in the report, you 
will see that the number of people has declined, as 
I recall, by some seven people from the previous 
year. Through attrition, we are continuing to 
reduce our staff. However, union contracts 
primarily account for the increase in salaries of 
those staff who are there. 

Mr. Storie: The only other question I had related 
to the efforts of the commission to increase sales. 
We discussed this in the previous committee 
meetings and certainly in the last couple of yeaiS, 
i n  t h e  l a s t  year i n  p articular,  the Liquor 
Commission has become involved in very heavy 
sales promotion, in-store promotions. You know, 
you walk into a commission, not that I visit very 
often, but you see the products of France and so 
forth displayed. You have tasting, you have all 
kinds of other gimmicks to increase the sales of 
alcohol. I guess the question is, is that something 
that other liquor commissions are involved in, and 
i s  that  something that  is  cons istent with 
responsible drinking, encouraging people to buy 
more? 

• (1010) 

Mr. Smith: Well, firstly, as I mentioned before, 
we are merchandising the products that we sell in a 
socially responsible way. Whether people are 
encouraged to buy more, I think perhaps it is more 
the impulse buying that we are trying to get people 
to do. Again, that is primarily on those products 
like wine, for people to take home wine to have 
with their meals as opposed to other products. 

It appealS to be a trend in other jurisdictions, that 
people are-other jurisdictions are doing more 
merchandising. Other liquor commissions and 
boards across the country are more heavily 
involved in tastings and sales and merchandising. 
We would like to think that we are perhaps a year 
or two ahead of them, but we believe very strongly 
that everything we do do, becanse it is part of our 
mandate, is to do it in a socially responsible way. 
So we do not think in any way, and we work very 
closely with some health advocacy groups and 
they are of the same opinion, that the products we 

are merchandising are not being merchandised to 

increase health problems. 

Mr. Storie: Again, in terms of the marketing, one 
of the strategies that was referred to in some 
training material that was pwportedly being used 
to assist in the service orientation of the sales staff 
was upselling. Personal experience in a Manitoba 
Liquor Commission outlet looking for a bottle of 
wine, I was referred to obviously more expensive 
types of wine. Are commission staff told to upsell? 

Mr. Smith: I do not believe they are told to upsell, 
but if there is an opportunity for someone who 
wants to purchase a product as a gift, very often 
that wine is offered or brought to celebrations of 
different types, and when someone comes into the 
store and is not familiar with different types of 
wines, rather than buying a cheap bottle of wine, 
an inexpensive bottle of wine, if it is being offered 
as a gift or as a memento of a celebration, the sales 
clerk will bring them to a good bottle of wine, 
something that may be enjoyed by the host or the 
individual and that may cost him a little bit more. 

You have to understand that most of the 
products that we sell in terms of wine in our stores 
are less than $10, so it is a pretty inexpensive gift . 
It may run from $7.50 to $8.25. 

Mr. Storie: Well, Mr. Chaiiperson, I think there 
are probably lots of Canadian wineries which take 
exception to the idea that the upselling that is 
going on is to good wines, but that is a matter of 
taste, and we will leave that for the moment. 

My direct question was, are our sales agents of 
the Manitoba Liquor Commission encouraged, 
directed, to upsell? 

Mr. Smith: No, they are not. 

Mr. Storie: The next question relates in a way to 
the issue of warning labels on alcohol containeiS. 
Some year ago, or a little more, I visited the Liquor 
Commission and visited with Mr. Smith and his 
staff and discussed at that time the obligation, at 
least I felt an obligation on the part of the Liquor 
Commission, to come to grips with the problems 
that alcohol creates in our society and raised the 
question of whether the Liquor Commission 
collected, had access to; was worki ng with 
agencies to make sure of the kinds of statistics that 
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we might want, how many people are currently 
and continuing to suffer from the effects of 
alcoholism, how many new alcoholics are being 
reported, do we have any mechanism to keep track 
of it? 

I am wondering if Mr. Smith or Mr. Holmes can 
give us some update on where the commission is 
on those issues. 

Mr. Smith: We work very closely with the 
Addictions Foundation of Manitoba, who keep all 
those statistics. We do not wish to duplicate their 
efforts. They have the experts, and we work very 
closely with them in just about everything we do. 
When we talked about merchandising, if we 
introduce a new program we check with the 
Addictions Foundation to make sure that-not that 
they are in agreement, but that it would not violate 
some of the objectives that the foundation has. 

In terms of providing information to our 
customers who may abuse alcohol. Since 1992, we 
have had a partnership with the Addictions 
Foundation, along with some other groups, to 
provide information to our customers through our 
stores on the dangers of consuming alcohol, 
whether it is during pregnancies or whether it is in 
conjunction with other drugs, alcohol and seniors, 
a whole host of informational pamphlets that we 
provide. 

We have also put up a number of posters, all of 
which deal with drinking alcohol while pregnant. 
In fact, just recently, as a result of a partnership 
that has come about between the native physicians 
of Canada or native physicians in Canada and the 
brewers association, they have provided us with 
posters which we will put in all our stores and in 
liquor vendors in most parts of Manitoba. We will 
certainly make it available for them to put it up, 
and this depicts a native family and brings the 
message about consuming alcohol while pregnant. 

We are working very closely with health groups 
and other groups on a national basis to try to 
provide information to all Manitobans, the dangers 
of alcohol with whatever the situation is. 

Mr. Storie: Well, Mr. Chairperson, unless we 
have some way of knowing where we started from, 
in terms of how much people were drinking, 

whether women who are pregnant were drinking, 
how many alcoholics we are producing, how many 
kids are beginning to drink, we will never know 
whether we are successful. It will always be a 
relative fact. 

Does the commission give any money directly to 
groups like the Addictions Foundation or other 
groups to do base research on those questions? 

Mr. Smith: The commission provides all of its 
profit to the government, and the government 
funds the Addictions Foundation of Manitoba. So 
although we do not provide monies directly, we do 
provide funds through the government for the 
necessary work and the good work that the 
Addictions Foundation of Manitoba does. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, my question is to 
Mr. Holmes. Is it within the purview of the board 
of the Manitoba Liquor Commission to decide on 
its own that it wants to fund research? Could the 
Manitoba Liquor Commission simply, as they did 
with the recycling issue, work with an outside 
agency, provide support and begin to address the 
question, perhaps the most important one on fetal 
alcohol effect? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: As the president has already 
indicated, the Addictions Foundation is funded by 
government from general government revenues, 
part of which we get from the MLCC. I think the 
president has already indicated that there is a 
c oncern within the MLCC to be soci ally 
responsible, and I think the board and the 
commission can be commended on many of the 
initiatives they have taken. 

If the question is, can we do more? I think that 
there are areas that we want to explore, in terms of 
working with the Addictions Foundation and other 
groups out there to do the appropriate messaging, 
and we will be exploring those. 

Mr. S torie: I am assuming the minister has 
indirectly answered my question, that the 
Manitoba Li quor Commission does have the 
l egislative authority to p rovide money to 
who mever they wish for purposes such as 
research. 

Now whether the government grants money to 
the Addictions Foundation is irrelevant. The 
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Liquor Commission does provide money to other 
groups and other agencies and is joined in 
partnership with other groups and agencies on its 
own hook. 

My question was to the chairperson of the board, 
who I believe is responsible for establishing 
policy,  the question was: Has the Liquor 
Commission provided money for research or is it 
prepared to consider providing money for research 
so we can get to the direct question of where we 
are at ,  before we p u rsue more aggressive 
marketing of alcohol, before we get into perhaps 
the escalating privatization of alcohol sales and 
other matters? 

• (1020) 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I think what the member is 
suggesting is that rather than the commission 
providing the funds directly to government that we 
withhold some of those funds and give them 
directly to the Addictions Foundation. It is 
probably more important from a government point 
of view to have those funds flow from government 
so we have an understanding of what needs the 
Addictions Foundation has. H they, in fact, require 
more funding, then they can make their case to the 
Department of Health which actually does the 
funding of the Addictions Foundation. 

But the member leaves on the record, you know, 
comments about more aggressive selling and other 
things that he has got running around in his mind, 
the fact is that this commission, as well as others 
across the country, has changed and changed to 
reflect changes in society. 

I can well remember in my university days in 
Brandon when there was one outlet in Brandon. 
During the Christmas and New Year's season, 
people used to line up across the room and out the 
door and down the street to fill in the little form 
with the appropriate number and present it at the 
commission Certainly in rural Manitoba we have 
even had changes now where customers have 
direct access to the product and can look at the 
products and ask the staff for information on 
wines, what is appropriate with certain meals, and 
as the president indicated, when giving a gift what 

would be appropriate for certain ethnic groups and 
so forth. 

These changes have taken place, and I am not 
sure whether the member for Flin Flon wants to 
turn the clock back or not. The commission has 
become more of a service centre rather than going 
ahead with the heavy duty controls that used to be 
in place on the relationship between staff and 
customers. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, I certainly do not 
want to turn the clock back at all and if the minister 
had, I guess, been involved in the debates over the 
last number of years, he would have known that I 
have always supported the liberalization of some 
of the archaic provisions of The Manitoba Liquor 
Control Act. 

That is not the issue. The issue is whether we are 
now trying to sell more alcohol simply for the sake 
of selling more alcohol. No one is talking about 
accessibility; no one is talking about the person to 
right to choose; no one is talking about the limits. 
What we are talking about now is a marketing 
strategy that is more like Wal-Mart than a 
government agency. 

There is a legitimate concern there and the 
minister may want to take it back. I think if we 
were here dealing with the Manitoba Lotteries 
Foundation, there were people addressing the same 
concern that we are now not just allowing the 
activity, making sure that it operates in an efficient 
manner and consistent with good business practice 
or whatever, we are now promoting it as a lifestyle 
and an activity. I think the Liquor Commission to 
this point has not proceeded too far, but I think it is 
a dangerous trend. I am not sure whether it should 
be a matter of government policy to upsell, to sell 
people more alcohol than they perhaps originally 
desired or to market alcoholic products simply as a 
means of making money for the government. 

As a matter of policy, I think it is wrong. 
Liberalization has nothing to do with that. Access 
has nothing to do with it. I certainly think that 
provinces like Quebec have certainly far swpassed 
us in terms of providing access to the product but 
that does not deal with the question of whether the 
Liquor Commission should be attempting to sell 
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more alcohol than people really want, encouraging 
them to drink in effect. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: Well, I am pleased that the 
member for Flin Flon has clarified his views on 
that because I was not of the opinion that the 
member for Flin Flon supported liberalization. I 
am glad to hear that because I think we have to 
have stores and staff which reflect to a certain 
degree what society wants. I know with the 
changes that were brought about last year, there 
was widespread support in the public and in the 
media for making some of those changes. 

The stores certainly still have a respomibility on 
the control side to see that the product is sold 
responsibly and to the appropriate aged persons, 
but at the same time I think they also are quite 
within their mandate to have professional staff 
who are knowledgeable about the product, and 
when customers are asking for advice on certain 
products that they have some background training 
to offer that advice in a responsible way. 

The member talks about the sale of the product. 
The numbers in the annual report do not show any 
marked change in the sale of alcohol through the 
commission system over the last number of years. 
You have to balance that with the education 
responsibility that ihe commission and others have 
to warn about the dangers of abusing alcohol, 
whether it is through the Addictions Foundation or 
through education programming, pamphlets, 
posters a nd other that the commissio n  is 
responsible for. So there has to be some balance 
there. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, I guess we can boil 
that one down to a philosophical argument, and I 
think that the minister may be incorrect in his 
assumption that most Manitobans support some of 
the activities that the Liquor Commission is 
currently u ndertaking. The minister maybe 
referenced some of the recent liberalizations. I do 
not know whether he was specifically referring to 
wine boutiques ,  but that is not the kind of 
liberalization I.was talking about certainly. If the 
minister had been in the committee when that issue 
was raised, he would have found that the vast 
majority of presenters opposed that particular 

move on the part of the government. I will not 
blame that on the Liquor Commission. 

Having said that, I would like to know from the 
minister perhaps or the chairperson of the board 
where we are in terms of the establishing of these 
new wine boutiques. How many have been 
established to date? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: Mr. Chairperson, none have 
been established to date. We have been doing 
considerable work on the regulations surrounding 
wine stores, and after reviewing the legislation and 
looking at some of the background on that and 
working towards to establishing the discount rates 
for wine stores and receiving ideas and opinions 
from the commission, from people working in 
policy, from Crown corporations, from a number 
of sources, we have moved to hire an outside 
consultant to look at the discount structures that 
are in place with our vendors and looking at and 
analyzing the whole range of issues around 
establishing them. We are just awaiting a report 
from that consultant, and once that is in place, we 
will be moving ahead with these in the very near 
future. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, this is really quite 
humorous. This is quite funny. It is just so typical 
of everything this government does. First, you 
announce you are going to do it. Then you find 
out-then you hire someone. Now we have a new 
consultant to see how we are going to do this and 

what it is going to cost us and what kind of a 
discount rate we are going to establish. 

We knew at the time, and it is part of the record 
of this committee in the debate on the amendments 
of The Manitoba Liquor Control Act, that this 
initiative of the government was pushed by a 
couple of people only who visited with the 
minister responsible at the time and who initiated 
this. Now it is becoming more obvious that not 
only was the government moving on the basis of 
political motivation or some over agenda, but now 
we find out that they did not know what they were 
doing. 

• (1030) 
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Mr. Chaitperson, I want to know, first of all, 

who is paying for the consultant? Who is the 
consultant? How much are we paying him or her? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I think the member is 

factually incorrect. There has been wide-spread 

support for looking at the wine store initiative, and 

the member cannot have it both ways. If we had 

moved without doing the research into some very 
important detail surrounding the establishment of 

the wine stores, he would have been critical on the 

other side of this. 

We are taking the time to look at the regulations 

surrounding the wine stores, and we are very near 

to having that worlc completed. The consultant that 

was hired was the Arthur Andersen company, and 
they, in the very near future, will be bringing 

forward those recommendations to the board of 

commissioners who are responsible for seeking 

that outside advice. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, I want to thank the 

minister for answering one part of the question, 

who. Now we want to know how much. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I d o  not  have that 

information in front of me and I am not sure if Mr. 

Smith does. 

Mr. Smith: I can find that information for the 

member. 

Mr. Storie: And the other question was, who 
asked for the study? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I had indicated t o  the 

member that after wodcing with the board, with the 
staff at the commission and trying to resolve issues 
around the regulations and around the discount 

rates, and as a result of a variety of opinions around 
those rates, the commission has been responsible 
for retaining the Arthur Andersen Company to 
bring forward recommendations around those 

regulations. 

Mr. Storie: So, Mr. Chairperson, we are going to 
assume that we are blowing another $50,000 or 
$60,000 on Arthur Andersen, but the minister does 

not have the figures and he will get the figures. 

Point of Order 

Mr. Gilleshammer: On a point of order, the 
member is wildly throwing out figures. I had 
committed to giving him the exact figure, and I 
would urge him not to speculate wildly on that 
figure. 

Mr. Chairperson: The minister did not have a 
point of order. He had a point, but not a point of 
order. 

••• 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, i t  is not wild 
speculation. The only, I guess, possibility is that it 
would err slightly on the low side, probably. 

There is another facet to the minister's answer 
that needs to be addressed. I had asked earlier 
whether the Liquor Commission could hire other 
people to investigate things like the number of 
fetal alcohol syndrome children there are in 
Manitoba, and the minister has just acknowledged 
that the Liquor Commission basically now is doing 
the bidding of the government. 

It was the government's direction to introduce 
wine boutiques, not the Liquor Commission's, and 
he is telling us now that the Liquor Commission 
has authorized an independent group to study the 
question of how we are going to do this and in 
what manner. It does not make sense that we can 
find the money, however many dollars the minister 
is going to finally say this costs, to do that when we 
cannot ask the Liquor Commission to deal with the 
health questions which are, in most people's minds 
much more important than the question of when 
we get wine boutiques established in the province. 

Two other points, Mr. Chairperson. The minister 
talked about moved without research. Well, of 
course,  the government did move without 
research. The legislation was on our desks last year 
before the government did one iota of research. 
Not only did the government not do any research, 
but the government moved without any public 
consultation. 

So the government and the minister cannot have 
it both ways. You cannot announce you are doing 
something and a year and half later say we are 
going to study it, and talk about moving at a pace 
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that is responsible. We already have legislation 

that  a l l o w s  for t h e  est ablishment of wine 
boutiques. 

If the minister  w a n t s  t o  d o  some thing 
responsible, then simply announce now that we 
will have no wine boutiques, because it is going to 
cost the province money, regardless of what the 
discount rate is finally established at. It is going to 
cost the Liquor Commission, in the long run, staff 

and employment. It was an error in judgment, and • 

the minister can save himself and his government a 
lot of trouble by announcing today that they are 
cancelling that particular initiative. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: Well, the member for F1in 
Flon has never been accused of not being able to 
weave his way through a number of different 
scenarios with some issues that are factually 
incorrect and drawing wrong conclusions. On the 
issue of health initiatives, it has been clearly stated 
to the member that the Addictions Foundation is 
funded by the Department of Health, and that if he 
wants to advocate on behalf of the Addictions 
Foundation to provide more funds, then he should 
probably go to the Health Estimates and debate 
that with the Minister of Health Our money goes 
into general revenue, some of which flows to the 
Addictions Foundation to do that very important 
work that they do in the community. 

The member also has indicated again some 
figures that he has drawn out of the air. I have 
indicated very clearly that I would get the correct 
figures for him, and I know he wants to put on the 
record numbers that are exaggerated and that he 
wants to use for his own political purposes. I 
would just ask the member to be patient. He has 
asked for information that we do not have with us 
here today, and I have made a commitment to get 
that information for him. 

We have, through the commission, hired the 
Arthur Andersen company specifically to look at 
the discount rates so that we can work with 
proponents of the wine stores and let them know 
what those rates will be. There were varying 
opinions that came from different groups that were 
consulted, and I think it is very important that 
those rates be set appropriately at the beginning. 

I do not apologize for taking a little more time 
than the member for F1in Flon (Mr. Storie) thought 
I should take in putting this initiative into place. I 
think it is very important that we have the 
appropriate background surrounding those rates 
before we go ahead, and as a result, the Arthur 
Andersen company was contracted to bring a 
recommendation to the board surrounding those 
rates. Once that is done, we will be moving more 
quickly to have these wine stores put in place. 

Mr. Storie: Well, Mr. Chairperson, the minister 
has levelled some accusations about my ability to 
twist facts. Of course, the minister is a master of 
that himself and continues to dance around the 
proposition that the Liquor Commission can 
engage any agency,  n o t  the Ad dictions 
Foundation, any agency it wishes, any private 
consulting group, and there are many who could 
address the question of the impact of fetal alcohol 
syndrome in Manitoba. They have that ability. 

It does not have to be addressed through the 
Addictions Foundation. I am not just saying that 
they could not be, I guess, contracted to undertake 
that kind of research as well, but the minister 
understands my point, and he continues to abuse 
the truth in that regard. 

I want to ask a more--

Point of Order 

Mr. Gilleshammer: On a point of order, I would 
suggest, Mr. Chairperson, that the member is using 
unparliamentary language that he might wish to 
withdraw. 

Mr. Chairperson: I would ask the honourable 
member to withdraw the "abuse the truth" from his 
statement, please. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, if "abuse the truth" 
is an unparliamentary term, I will certainly 
withdraw it. 

Mr. Chairperson: Thank you, Mr. Storie. 

••• 

Mr. Gilleshammer: The member is weaving his 
way through a number of issues, and if specifically 
he would like to talk about fetal alcohol syndrome, 
which I think he was getting around to asking a 
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more direct question on, yes, in the legislation last 
year a commitment was made to move ahead with 
some messaging with the advocati ng-or 
indicating the dangers of alcohol consumption to 
women who are pregnant. I do believe that the 
commission has a responsibility in this area. 

• (1040) 

We are working not only with the Addictions 
Foundation. I met recently with a Dr. Bill Jacyk, 
who I think is known to the member. I am also in 
the process of having other meetings with groups 
with an interest in what we can do in terms of 
messaging about the use of alcohol while pregnant. 

At the present time, as the president has 
indicated, we have a number of pamphlets and 
posters within the store. We will also b e  
proceeding with some messaging on the packaging 
of a lcohol.  There are a number o f  issues 
surrounding that. I have had some samples brought 
forward, and I would hope that in the near future 
that too will be put in place. 

I am told by the commission that once we have 
found the appropriate messaging for packaging, 
within a matter of two weeks, that can be put in 
place, and once I have finished some of this 
consultation and looked at some of the samples 
that are being brought forward, we will be moving 
ahead with that initiative. 

Mr. Storie: Well, I appreciate the minister's 
efforts to move us on to the question of fetal 
alcohol syndrome because it is an important issue, 
but I want to go back to the question of our 
consultant for a minute. 

The minister has suggested that he does not have 
the numbers at hand, but given the fact that the 
Uquor Commission Board obviously approved the 
hiring of Arthur Andersen for this study. Given the 
intim ate kno wledge of the president of the 
activities of the Manitoba Uquor Commission, I 
would like to ask the president if he can tell us, 
within a few thousand dollars, what Arthur 
Andersen has received or will receive as a result of 
its contract? 

Mr. Smith: The initial contract has been modified 
to some extent, but we expect it to be somewhere 
less than $25,000. 

Mr. Storie: The contract has been modified to 
require more work, additional work? 

Mr. Smith: The contract was modified to extend 
some of the work, to do a little bit more analysis 
than what was originally estimated. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, in the final analysis 
what does the Uquor Commission expect to have 
to pay Arthur Andersen? 

Mr. Smith: Somewhat less than $25,000. 

Mr. Storie: So we have $25,000 that is being used 
now, at least that is the estimate, for researching a 
question which the government introduced, 
without public consultation, which the vast 
majority, certainly, of Manitobans had not asked 
for. In fact, when the minister was asked how 
many people she had seen that were asking for the 
introduction of wine boutiques, the answer was a 
handful. At the same time, the government and the 
Liquor C o mmission-it sounds l ike the 
g o vernment is discouraging the Liqu or 
Commission from researching other questions that 
I think are more important to most Manitobans. So 
I simply point out that I think that is inconsistent. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I would point out that the 
government is not discouraging the Liquor 
Commission from doing research. As the member 
knows, there are sometimes other agencies doing 
the same work, and I know that he would not be 
encouraging the government to duplicate work that 
is already being done. From time to time in 
government we do see a number of government 
departments and agencies working on the 
periphery of some of the same issues, and it is 
important that we eliminate s o m e  of the 
duplication when that occurs. Also, at the same 
time, when there are differing opinions or if there 
is a lack of information in a certain area it is not 
unusual for government departments and Crown 
corporations to go outside their staff resources to 
have someone else with some expertise come in 
and bring forth information to either the agency or 
to government. 

Mr. Storie: Is the minister telling me categorically 
the Addictions Foundation is doing research on 
fetal alcohol syndrome or fetal alcohol effects? 
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Mr. Gilleshammer: I am not aware of all of their 
research projects, but I do know that they have 
pamphlets which have been sent over to me, and 
that I will be meeting with them in the near future 
to review some of the work that they have done so 
that we can proceed with the messaging that I 
referenced earlier. 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, I think pamphlets 
are a long way from the kind of base research that 
perhaps we need to get a handle on what the impact 
is and has been over the last couple of decades in 
tenns of fetal alcohol syndrome. 

I had mentioned on a number of occasions that 
in discussions with regional medical health 
officers and medical health officers with the 
federal government that in many communities, 
remote communities, and communities in northern 
Manitoba the incidence is alanningly high, and the 
consequences are going to be staggering. I do not 
believe that the Addictions Foundation is doing 
any primary research whatsoever on this issue, but 
I will confirm that with the Addictions Foundation 
myself. 

The question is, Mr. Chairperson, what is the 
Liquor Commission going to do about labelling, 
about notifying its consumers as it undertook to do 
as a result of the amendments? 

I know that the brewers and the distillers are 
quite anxious not to have warning labels applied 
directly to alcohol containers. They met with me at 
the time that this was proposed, and they have all 
kinds o f  anecdotal reports about  it being 
ineffective and so forth in the United States. 

The only jurisdiction that applies right now 
warning l abels is the Yukon, and from my 
discussions with people in the Yukon, including 
some of the people who were in the government at 
the time, is that it is effective, that over the long 
term i t  does have an impact on peoples' 
consciousness about alcohol consumption. 

The smoking industry in the 1930s and '40s and 
1950s and '60s continued to resist putting any kind 
of warning labels on their cigarette packages. They 
sued states and individual legislators and so forth 
every time there was a suggestion that smoking 
was dangerous. 

I do not expect the brewing and the distilling 
industry to be particularly supportive of warning 
labels. I do not think that the minister, when he was 
buying his liquor and signing the little fonn that he 
used to have to sign eons ago, would have at that­
time predicted that smokers would end up being 
pariahs, that smoking would not be pennitted in 
committee rooms like this. 

The fact is that that kind of public awareness, the 
consciousness that that is damaging, it is not smart 
to do it, takes a long time to peiVade society. Until 
we get warning labels on individual bottles so 
people are reminded all the time of the dangers, we 
are not going to have any kind of su ccessful effort 
to constrain the consumption of alcohol. 

Prices may work for some people, but we all 
know that, as with cigarettes, price sensitivity only 
goes so far, and people find alternate means. As the 
price gets higher with alcohol, we have seen 
bootlegging increase and probably some making 
of home-made spirits increase, and so forth, and 
the potential for that is unlimited. 

The point is that we have a chance to slow the 
consumption, to moderate the consumption of 
alcohol, and we should do everything in our power 
to do that. Why the Manitoba Liquor Commission, 
why the Manitoba government would resist that 
kind of initiative is beyond me. Can you imagine 
today any minister of health, federally, standing up 
and saying, get the-oh, warning, warning, 
warning on cigarette package, oh, let us not do 
that. 

The fact is, Mr. Chairperson, that over the long 
haul-[interjection] Well, the member for Portage 
(Mr. Pallister) says let us lower the taxes. I can tell 
you that was another brain-dead initiative from a 
government. 

But the point is that we also have an obligation 
in tenns of the health of our kids and the health of 
our population, and there is no logical reason why 
the government would not take this initiative, 
none. There is no logical reason, unless they are 
simply concerned with the potential loss of 
revenue to the Manitoba Liquor Commission, and 
if that is the sole reason why the government does 
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not undertake the initiative, then that is in itself a 
sad commentary on the government. 

• (1050) 

So, Mr. Chairperson, I do not want pamphlets. 
The people who are concerned about this issue, the 
medical doctors, many of whom have expressed 
their views, including the Chief Medical Officer 
for the Province of Manitoba, want something 
substantive. They do not want posters. I know 
there are posters in the washrooms in m any 
alcohol-well, when the posters are in the 
washroom, that is four beers too late. 

The bottom line is-[interjection] Well, for the 
member for Niakwa (Mr. Reimer) maybe, too. The 
point is that everything that we can do to prevent 
the continuing problems that it is creating, we 
should do. I am just going to say that the minister 
may continue to talk about the generic things that 
the commission is doing, the government wants 
the commission to do. I am saying let us take the 
real step. Let us put warning labels that are direct, 
that do not beat about the bush on alcohol 
containers. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I m ay surp ris e my 
honourable friend, but I do agree with some of 
what he says. I do think we have a responsibility, 
and I have indicated we will be moving ahead with 
some initiative on the packaging. 

I have met, and I referenced earlier, with 
someone who is involved with some thoughts on 
this initiative last year, and I shared with him some 
of the samples that I had accumulated so far from a 
variety of sources. You know, I think the member 
recognizes that the messaging is for a variety of 
people out there, some of whom cannot read, some 
of whom their language is other than English. We 
are looking at a combination of both symbolism 
and appropriate language around the type of 
message that we want to give. 

I have heard from a variety of sources what they 
think might work. Unfortunately, we do not have, 
in other jurisdictions, a lot of examples that are out 
there now. We are trying to gather whatever 
information there is that we feel will be effective. 
Obviously, if people cannot read or write, we have 
to use some sort of symbolism. If the language in 

some communities is other than English, you 
know, there is a problem whereby we cannot do 
that messaging in a variety of languages . 

I will tell the member that I agree with much of 
what be has said, and his analogy to smoking I 
think is somewhat correct. Canada can be very 
proud that only about 30 percent of our population 
smokes. We of course are tremendously concerned 
with t axation issues that the federal Liberal 
government has moved on in recent months, which 
I think are going to show an increase in the use of 
cigarettes, particularly by young people. 

I know other people who do much more 
travelling than I do have been to countries where 
some 70 percent of the population is smoking, and 
I think Canada has done a tremendous job in 
lowering the number of people who actually 
smoke in the country. There is in many ways an 
unseen and unsubstantiated -savings to the health 
budgets of all the provinces and the federal 
government. I am just afraid that a lot of this is 
going to be undone with the modification to the 
t axes that has t a ken place by the federal 
government and the governments of Quebec and 
Ontario and others. 

So again, I am substantially agreeing with the 
member for Flin Flon (Mr. Storie), and I agree that 
pos ters are not  enough by themselves, that 
pamphlets are not enough by themselves. There 
are real difficulties when products come from such 
a variety of sources whereby Manitoba is a small 
recipient of that product and other jurisdictions are 
not onside. 

I know the member for F1in Flon is going to tell 

me there are other ways of doing it, and there are. 
We have made the comm itment, when that 
legislation was passed last year, to look at some 
messaging on p ack aging, and we will b e  
proceeding with that. If m y  honourable friend from 
Flin Flon even has some ideas on it, I would be 
happy to receive them from him. 

Now, having said that, I would like to also 
maybe have the president comment on some of the 
e xperiences that he would have with o ther 
commissions across the country and his 
knowledge of what is being contemplated or done 
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that has worked or has not worked in other 
jurisdictions. 

Mr. Smith: Mr. Chairperson, two years ago, in 
1992, as a result of a great deal of discussion 
amongst the Canadian Association of Liquor 
Jurisdiction, a committee was formed on social 
responsibility. I was fortunate enough to be the 
chair for that committee for two years. 

The committee met two or three times a year, 
expanded the committee from liquor jurisdictions 
to associations of brewers, of distillers and the 
Canadian wine industry. It had meetings with 
various health advocacy groups, including the 
AFM in Manitoba,  met with the Medical 
Association, met with a whole host of groups of 
people to determine which is the best way to get 
health warnings on packaging that would be 
effective. 

All the studies out of the United States had 
indicated that the health warning labels on alcohol 
were not effective-there are umpteen studies and 
they are available from the Addictions Foundation 
-that in fact the initiative that was taken in B.C. to 
put posters all over licensed premises, et cetera, et 
cetera, was not effective. 

Contrary to your comments, the information that 
w e  have from both government and liquor 
commission people in the Yukon is that the 
warning labels were not effective because of an 
illiteracy problem. I guess the big problem is that 
how do you effectively communicate to an 
individual who not only has an alcohol 
consumption problem, but also has other problems 
including poor nutrition perhaps, the abuse of 
other substances, has an illiteracy problem and 
whatever else that goes on? I can assure you we 
have worked very closely with the native resource 
group here in Winnipeg dealing with that problem. 

Add to that the problem with bootlegging into 
some of the northern communities that you speak, 
it is a very complex problem. We at the 
commission would dearly love to find a solution to 
any health problem that alcohol can cause, and that 
is for that reason we work closely with the experts, 
who are the Addictions Foundation people. We 
work closely with other jurisdictions across 

Canada.  We formed partnerships with the 
Addictions Foundation and other groups to do 
some things. The development of programs that 
are occurring across the country will be available 
to Manitoba on a no-cost basis other than the 
printing and other production costs, and it is a good 
alliance in order to keep abreast of these things. 

At the same time, we have kept very close to the 
Health Canada studies that were going on in 1991 
and 1992, particularly on fetal alcohol syndrome 
and effect. Studies were done. Research was done. 
Symposiums were held and it was clear that 
warning labels were not the solution, but in fact, 
education was the key factor that would prevent 
this preventable disease if you like. 

The other difficulty is that the Medical 
Association cannot agree on what the incidence of 
fetal alcohol syndrome is, neither here nor in the 
States nor in the world and that in itself is a major 
problem. But nevertheless, it is a preventable 
disease, whether it is one in a hundred or one in a 
thousand. It is a preventable disease and all the 
indications that we have from research, from 
medical associations, from Health Canada, from 
everybody else, indicates that the best way is 
through education. 

For that reason, we are trying to provide as much 
educational information to our customers as 
possible without, I guess, identifying particular 
groups by going to particular langu ages or 
symbols. But we will continue to be abreast of the 
latest developments, not only here in Canada, but 
in the world, and we will do everything that we can 
to provide as much education and as much warning 
if you like to customers about the health hazards 
associated with consuming alcohol. 

• (1100) 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, I appreciate those 
comments and I appreciate the interest of the 
commission in looking into this question. I just 
want to suggest to Mr. Smith and the minister that 
any suggestion right now that warning labels do 
not work I think is vastly premature. How long 
have warning labels been applied to cigarette 
packages? How long have doctors, the Surgeon 
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General in the United States, been talking about 
smoking? 

We have known, researchers,  scientific 
community, thinking people, for a long time that 
smoking is dangerous. Smoking causes problems 
during pregnancy, but to kind of absorb that in the 
societal sense, takes a long time. On the one hand, 
the brewers association and distillers and some 
others are saying education is what we need. Well, 
what the heck is a warning label on a bottle if it is 
not education? It is much more direct. 
[interjection] No, I am not saying that what you are 
going to see is a dramatic decrease in consumption 
during pregnancy simply because there is a 
warning label on the bottle, but common sense tells 
you that over time if the grandparents and the 
parents and the brothers and sisters and the friends 
of people who are consuming alcohol know that it 
is a problem, over time they will develop a 
collective conscience that says this is not right, we 
should not be doing this. It is a long-term prospect. 

The Yukon is an example. People I talked to say, 
yes, it does have an impact. People are talking 
about it Maybe the statistics do not show it at this 
point, but certainly if you have warning labels on 
bottles over a period of 10 years, most people will 
know that it is having an impact. Over 20, it may 
actually change their behaviour because there is a 
big gap between knowing something is wrong and 
stopping doing it. That is the nature of human 
behaviour, but that does not mean that it is not 
effective. 

I do not know how long they have been applying 
warning labels on alcohol bottles in the United 
States. I do know that in the case of smoking, 
thousands and thousands of people knew long 
before the Surgeon General put the warning on, 
and then it has taken two decades since that before 
you saw any effect on social behaviour. That does 
not mean we should not start doing it. 

Mr. Smith referenced the cost. In one 
community in my constituency there are 30--this 
is an estimate that comes from school officials 
-cases of fetal alcohol syndrome with fetal 
alcohol effect. That is the estimate. 

Anybody who has ever had any contact with 
someone who has full-fledged fetal alcohol 
syndrome appreciates the cost that society is going 
to incur to maintain that individual, all of the help, 
all of the support. I do not know bow much we are 
spending collectively on special needs students 
right now, but I can tell you that five or 10 or 15 

years from now that cost is going to escalate. 

The other parallel with smoking is that all of this 
time, since the 1940s, even though many, many 
people, scientists and others knew that smoking 
was dangerous, there was a consensus that it was 
dangerous, consumption increased. It increased for 
two decades after those warnings began, and it was 
only after 20 years of education, of putting the 
blunt message on there that we actually started to 
have an impact on the behaviour of people. 

It takes a long time. I am simply saying that for 
the Liquor Commission to dismiss what evidence 
there is already and, of course, there is no 
consistency between warning labels, it may take 
20 years before we actually see an effect, but every 
year we delay starting that process we are making 
a mistake. 

I understood from previous discussions with Mr. 
Smith that the Liquor Commission bad estimated 
that it might cost as much as $3 million or $4 
million to apply warning labels and warning 
labels, not only on the product that is produced in 
Manitoba but applying it at the commission, at our 
liquor stores in some appropriate way, so $3 
million or $4 million. 

I can assure you that we are spending that much 
and more every year on special needs kids, and you 
only have to prevent one case to save a million 
dollars over a lifetime, if you think that they are 
going to be on social assistance, they are going to 
need our support for their lifetime. 

It does not take very many cases to be prevented 
in a year and you will never find them in statistics. 
You will not be able to report that you have been 
successful, but it does not take very many cases to 
save us as a society a lot of money and an 
individual and a family a lot of grief. 
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The minister said I will make a suggestion. I 
make the suggestion that we go back to the 
warning that was simple and direct. It said: 
warning, drinking alcohol during pregnancy can 
cause birth defects. 

If you try and mix the message, if you try and 
prevent all of the ills that are potentially created by 
alcohol on a warning label, it will not have any 
effect. It seems to me that keeping it simple and 
direct may prevent part of the problem. You can 
use all of the other educational tools at your 
disposal to try and deal with some of the other 
effects. 

I appreciate that the minister is talking about 
proceeding. I hope that we have warning labels on 
alcohol bottles. I hope that the message is direct. I 
hope that we have it sooner rather than later 
because every year we delay we are going to pay 
for it, and families are going to pay for it and 
individuals are going to pay for it. 

We may not be able to measure, you know, the 
distillers and the brewers and others who are doing 
research in this field may not be able to measure it, 
but they probably could not measure the general 
attitude shift in smoking either until it started to 
show up. It may take 20 years but let us start now. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: Again I would indicate to the 
member that I appreciate his input and that we will 
be seeking that input from whatever source that we 
can to get more information on that, and I would 
even appreciate if he would table his analysis that 
says that each case costs government a million 
dollars. That would be very helpful if he could give 
that to me, because I think it is evidence that we 
would like to use in getting a better understanding 
of the whole issue, and I am sure that if you have 
any other documentation around that, it could be 
very helpful for both the commission and myself. 

I think I also agree that-

Point of Order 

Mr. Storie: Mr. Chairperson, it is, I guess, a 
coincidence that the current Minister responsible 
for the Liquor Commission is also a former 
Minister responsible for Family Services. Given 
the debilitating nature of fetal alcohol syndrome, 

you can assume that someone in society is going to 
have to care for that individual for their lifetime in 
effect, and I do not think there is any doubt that 
even assuming that they were on minimal social 
assistance, never mind the other supports that they 
probably need, over a lifetime that would be a 
million dollars. That is where the figure comes 
from. 

Mr. Chairperson: The honourable member did 
not have a point of order. It is a dispute over the 
facts. 

• • •  

Mr. Gilleshammer: Well, I thank the member for 
that clarification, that his analysis w as an 
assumption, but I think he is, you know, correct, 
that in my experience in the Child and Family 
Services agencies, a lot of the individuals who end 
up accessing either child welfare or social 
assistance do have medical problems. Again, it is 
that kind of data that I think is helpful across 
departments to bring in programming and allow us 
to share that with the board and the staff at the 
commission to give them a better understanding of 
it. So, again, I would urge him, if he has any 
information or contribution he would like to make, 
I would be happy to look at that evidence. 

I think the member also has acknowledged that, 
you know, the type of thrust that we need in terms 
of having people understand the health risks from 
alcohol has many dimensions to it. I know he 
referenced his experience with a poster in the 
washroom of a hotel or whatever. I think we have 
got to get that message into the doctors' offices, 
into the schools, into the health clinics, into the 
nursing stations and have professional staff in 
many disciplines, in many jurisdictions carrying 
that common message, and the education is a 
combination of all of those things. 

It is, you know, I think, foolish to sort of scoff at 
a poster and pretend that is the only educational 
initiative that someone is taking to highlight a real 
health concern, a real health issue. It is when you 
put the whole package together and see everything 
that is being done by agencies, by the commission, 
by schools, hospitals, those professionals who in 
one way or another, whether it is through the social 
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services or the Health department or Education 
department, deal with the children who are victims 
of alcohol abuse in many ways, that we can decide 
whether we have got an adequate program or not. 
So I would encourage the member to look at all of 
those initiative s  in a very broad w ay ,  and 
everything we do c an play a small part in 
providing the appropriate education for those who 
are at risk. Thank you. 

* (1 1 10) 

Mr. Kowalski: Yes, I have really enjoyed this 
discussion. I do not have the benefit of the 
collective memory of this building as much in 
coming from a small caucus with limited research 
capabilities. I do not always have the background 
that I would like to have on these topics, but I do 
have some personal experiences with fetal alcohol 
syndrome. My figure is of $1.25 million dollars of 
cost for government services for every child that 
has full-blown fetal alcohol syndrome. That comes 
from Val Surbey who runs an organization for 
parents who have adopted children with fetal 
alcohol syndrome. [interjection] 1 .25 million. 

When I look at the profit from the Liquor 
Control Commission of $165 million, that it would 
just bit 165 children, fetal alcohol syndrome, to eat 
away any government revenues that we get from 
liquor sales in Manitoba, we have to really 
question the whole benefit of this revenue. 

On the subject of warning labels, the analogy to 
smoking, I think if we look at who still continues to 
smoke in Canada, it is teenagers, young women 
who are the smokers, and who are having-so it 
shows that for that group warning labels on 
cigarettes have been ineffective. 

Who are having the fetal alcohol syndrome 
children? It is teenagers, young women, the same 
group that did not heed the warning labels on 
cigarette packages. I am cynical that they would 
heed the warning labels on alcohol packages. 

I agree with the minister, education is the key, 
and an anecdotal incident, as I remember, a 
1 5-year-old girl, who I once arrested, who that 
morning she had her third child, a fetal alcohol 
syndrome child, she gave birth. That evening she 
was out prostituting herself for change to buy sniff 

to continue on. Now a warning label on a liquor 
bottle would not have made a bit of difference. 

So if it is going to cost $3 million or $4 million 
for warning labels, is that the best use of that $3 
million or $4 million? Are there good educational 
programs for that $3 million or $4 million that 
would be more effective? 

Of course, we want to do something, but I do not 
want to run and just do something. I want to do 
what is most effective. If we are going to put 
money into this, I do not know if we have really 
got the sense of the urgency and importance of this 
issue. Whether you believe it from a moral and a 
socially responsible perspective that this is an 
important issue or even from being fiscally 
responsible, the cost to this province of fetal 
alcohol syndrome, not only in Health, not only in 
Family Services, but in Justice, and in so many 
different areas, it is j ust phenomenal, just 
unbelievable. 

I have seen it for 20 years as a police officer. 
Now we are de aling with the children of the 
children that I dealt with in the justice system as a 
result of fetal alcohol syndrome. 

So I think going back to what the member for 
Flin Flon (Mr. Storie) was saying about research, I 
would like the Liquor Control Commission board 
to seriously examine the possibility of doing more 
research into this very important issue, that out of 
this $ 165 million profit would be lessened, of 
course, if some research was done. But on the other 
hand, for every child that w� stop from having fetal 
alcohol syndrome we are saving $1 .25 million into 
the province's general revenues. So it is fiscally 
responsible to do that type of research. 

Just going to the report on page 1 5  under 
Disciplinary Action, I noted that there is a drop in 
disciplinary hearings, a dramatic drop. Can 
someone from the board tell me what that could be 
attributed to? Why has there been such a drop in 
hearings? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I will let Mr. Smith answer 
the question on the disciplinary hearings, but I 
welcome the member's  contributions and 
comments on the whole issue of fetal alcohol 
syndrome and the health costs incurred both in 
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smoking and in the use of alcohol, and I think the 
member brings many unique perspectives to the 
Legislature because of his background as a police 
officer, just as those who work in the health system 
or in the education system or if perhaps they had 
been social workers, come in contact with citizens 
across the province who have succumbed to either 
smoking or drinking. 

I am interested certainly to see that the member 
has an open mind on how we do that messaging 
and how we do that education. If I heard him 
correctly, he is saying that if we are going to spend 
$3 million or $4 million on labelling on bottles, 
that we should maybe decide whether that is the 
best way to spend it. 

Maybe there is another way to do that education 
through some of the institutions that we have and 
some of the opportunities that we have to talk to 
young pregnant mothers or young women before 
they become pregnant because I think it is obvious 
to most people that the health damage that is done 
often is done from products that do not come off 
the shelf of a liquor commission. There are a whole 
variety of products out there that create the health 
risks and the health hazards that young people and 
young expectant mothers get themselves into. 

I think that in a time of very scarce dollars where 
we want to do the best we possibly can in 
Education and Health and Family Services, the 
member is quite right in saying we have to 
examine just where we place those expenditures. 

You know it is a little bit of a change, I think, 

from where the member's party was even a year 
ago. I welcome that openness and the feeling that 
we should examine how those dollars are spent and 
do the best possible job we can do. 

On the disciplinary hearings, I would ask Mr. 
Smith to comment on that. 

Mr. Smith: The number of disciplinary hearings 
has, in fact, decreased because our inspectors have 
spent a great deal of their time providing education 
to licensees, not only licensees but to hall owners 
and permittees which is on the same chart on page 
15. 

Again, I guess very similar to what we are 
talking about is the type of  education our 
inspection department has provided to licensees, in 
particular, has been effective because the number 
of disciplinary hearings is down. 

You will notice that the warning letters and the 
infonnal hearings are up slightly. The number of 
total days suspended is up significantly, primarily 
because one licensee lost their licence for 30 days 
because of continued breach of The Liquor Control 
Act 

We found that working with the licensees from 
the point of view of education, providing seminars, 
spending time explaining The Liquor Control Act 
and the regulations has been very effective. 

Mr. Kowalski: I just want to congratulate the 
chief executive officer for one initiative that I have 
seen where there was a problem on Main Street 
with the use of nonpotable substances,  and 
working with the community, working with the 
police, one solution that was found was to open the 
liquor stores earlier and sell some cheaper 
products. So although it was a short-tenn solution, 
we still have these people who are addicted to 
alcohol, but as a result many of the store owners in 
the area are not being harassed by these people, 
and I want to congratulate you for that initiative. 

• (1120) 

The other topic that I wanted to ask is the 
Conservative government in Alberta went through 
an experiment-! do not know if it is an 
experiment, but they have gone to privatization of 
retail liquor stores, and there have been a number 
of initiatives from Alberta that have been looked 
upon by this government. 

I am wondering if there have been any studies, 
any examination? Has this government, does it 
plan to follow in the footsteps of Ralph Klein in 
Alberta? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: Well, I am not sure how well 
the member knows the various outlets there are in 
the province of Manitoba. In much of rural 
Manitoba, there already is a private delivery 
system whereby the products from the commission 
are purchased at a licensed.---<>r a store, sometimes 
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it is a hardware store or a drugstore or an insurance 
office. So that change has taken place over the last 
20 and 30 years. As far as any further changes, that 
is a discussion that has not taken place. 

I think that every jurisdiction in Canada watches 
with some interest what other jurisdictions are 
doing. I know that Mr. Smith and his executive at 
the commission attend conferences and share 
information. Over the next three or four or five 
years, I think the commission will have an 
opportunity, and the board of the commission will 
have an opportunity to review how changes in 
other jurisdictions have taken place. 

So the answer is no, we have not had that 
discussion within government, and we are very 
pleased with the way that our commission is 
operating.  We have in place the Crown 
Corporations Council, which reviews all of our 
Crown agencies. They consistently have brought 
forward the report that our Manitoba Liquor 
Control Commission is worldng well. 

The discussion that we got into from the 
departed member from Flin Flon over some very 
modest changes that were made last year when 
legislation was passed to permit the establishment 
of wine stores is something that this government 
has committed to, but it should not be seen as any 
more than that. 

Mr. Kowalsk i: On another subject, 
microbreweries , the sale of microbrewery 
products, considering that the First Ministers have 
met recently and talked about taking down barriers 
between interprovincial trade and the liquor 
board's position on the sale of microbrewery 
products from other provinces, will there be any 
change in that position? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: The member quite correctly 
has referenced this as a trade issue, and that debate 
is going on between ministers of Trade involved 
interprovincially. Our province has consistently 
advocated the dropping of all barriers between 
provinces, and there are a number of good 
examples where we have led the w ay in 
interprovincial trade. 

Unfortunately, all other provinces have not seen 
it the same way. So that debate is taking place at 

the Trade ministers' level. I guess we-as myself 
being minister responsible on the board, and the 
commission-will have to await the outcome of 
those discussions that take place between the 
provincial Trade ministers. 

Mr. Kowalski: For my information, is beer from 
the major breweries treated differently for inter­
provincial trade than beer from these 
microbreweries by the Liquor Control 
Commission? 

Mr. Smith: Part of the difficulty-and it is a very 
complicated one, so I will try to answer it as simply 
as I can-is that the province to the east of us has 
set some policies which virtually prohibits beer 
from any province to enter into their system unless 
it goes through their warehouse and they are 
charged a handling fee. This would include any 
beer that is made in Manitoba by the large 
breweries which are Jfresently servicing 
northwestern Ontario. 

We wish to protect that business because it is a 
major part of the brewery business in Manitoba, 
and so far that has been the case. I guess except for 
Ontario all of the provinces accept beer that is 
made in other provinces. In Manitoba we accept 
beer from B.C., Alberta, Saskatchewan and New 
Brunswick, but we would like a level playing field 
and a reciprocal arrangement with the province to 
the east of us in terms of beer flowing east to west 
and west to east, but it is a trade issue. 

Mr. Kowalski: So this trade issue, the discussions 
are ongoing. Any expectation of any resolution? 
Any date that we can expect to see a resolution? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I really do not have any idea 
of how they are. It would just be speculation. I 
think there are a lot of issues on the table within 
provincial trade that those ministers are wrestling 
with. 

Mr. Clif Evans (Interlake): Mr. Chairperson, I 
will be brief. I just have a few points to make. First 
of all, I would jusf like to say and welcome the 
group here from the Manitoba Liquor 
Commission. Over the past many years I have had 
the opportunity to deal with them on a very good 
basis, I hope. 
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Being a licensee myself for many years, I have 
had the opportunity to deal with the Manitoba 
Liquor Commission. Not always have I agreed 
with some things, but in general, I think the Liquor 
Commission has done a very fine job. 

I would just like to bring up a point concerning 
1be Liquor Act. I have a copy and I should have 
perhaps made copies, but something within my 
constituency has come up and I would like to get 
some clarification. 

We are under the understanding that young 
people under the age of 18, of course, should not 
be consuming alcohol. However, there is, under 
the act, children, if you want to call it, or young 
people under 18 can indeed consume alcohol if 
they are with their parents or guardian or spouse on 
a regulated basis either in a cocktail lounge or 
restaurant or at home. 

Now, a constituent of mine was visiting some 
people, his girlfriend's place, and had a beer. The 
parent offered, and there was a general agreement 
between the two families that you know at home 
under their supervision if either one wanted to 
enjoy a beer that so be it The young fellow on his 
way home was stopped by the RCMP, on his spot 
check I presume, and was ticketed. He admitted to 
having a beer, but was ticketed, and claimed that it 
was under The Liquor Act. 

Now, he was not charged for anything else, was 
not given a breathalyzer. Yet, he was ticketed and 
the ticket stated that the ticket was presented under 
a section of The Liquor Act, and as yet I have not 
been able to find out exactly-the young fellow is 
away working and I do not have a copy of the 
ticket. This is coming from a constituent. It just 
seems rather odd. 

I mean I am not condoning it one little bit that 
people under the age of 18, you know without 
proper supervision, should be drinking, nor 
driving. However, the situation arises that this 
same young fellow could be with his parents at 
dinner at a restaurant and have come in two cars 
and have one beer and is taking his girlfriend home 
on one side of the block, and his parents go home, 
and get stopped. What would the charges be? 

• (1 130) 

The claim that I am wondering is that the officer 
stated that it was under The Liquor Act, and the 
fine is rather severe, which I guess it should be. 

Mr. Smith: I do not want to provide a reply on 
behalf of the RCMP, but I assume your constituent 
was a minor, and I assume that the consumption of 
liquor, of beer, was in the residence of his friends. 
However, there is a section in the act, and it is 
121(5), that says: "Any person under the full age of 
1 8  years who has in his possession or consumes 
liquor, other than as permitted by this Act, is guilty 
of an offence. 

I gather, if he was asked by the RCMP if he had 
c onsumed liquor and he answered in the 
affirmative, he would be provided some type of 
citation. I really cannot answer any more than 
there is a section in the act under which he can be 
charged. 

Mr. Clif Evans: The other side of my concern 
here again is that there has to be, I guess, some sort 
of discretion. I mean, the act is there, the law is 
there, so it is discretionary on the part of the 
officer, whether it be RCMP or whether it be the 
City of Winnipeg police or any other police 
department. 

But again, realizing that it is there, situations like 
this could lead to many of these. Your court again 
could be full of young people who have been with 
their parents, you know, total control, and then 
being charged because this is here. And I say that 
this should be here because we do see a lot of 
underage young people drinking more than the one 
beer, and that is what we are hoping we can stop. 

In some certain situations, I guess the fmes 
and/or the ticket or the citation can lead to a future 
charge for the person or a future record. So if this 
same young person, if the same thing was to 
happen three months later, the exact same 
situation, he is looking at a fine or imprisonment of 
a term of not more than 18 months. 

So where do we get this discretion from? From 
the law officers or can we-is there anything that 
can be done? That is what I am asking. 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I recognize that as MLAs we 
are often brought issues to do with the law by our 
constituents. Sometimes it is good advice for them 
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to seek help from a lawyer if they are having 
difficulty with that. But the member's point is well 
taken. 

Mr. C1if Evans: I have done that I am here just 
clarifying and making a point with the Liquor 
Commission that perhaps somehow, between the 
Liquor Commission and the law enforcement 
people , there should be s ome sort of a 
communique or something that can be set down 
and discussed with them. You know, the future for 
some of these young people who are just enjoying 
themselves and the company of either their parents 
or other people could put them in jeopardy. That is 
just my point. 

Mr. Kowalski: Being presumptuous, I assume 
that that provision that allows for children under 
the age of 18 to drink in the company of their 
parents has the assumption that they will continue 
to be under the control of their parents while they 
are under the effects of alcohol. I am assuming that 

that is the expectation, that if I am going to allow 
my child to have a cocktail, to have a glass of wine, 
to have a beer with me that I will continue to be 
with my child during the time they are under the 
effects. 

Just for information, I am surprised that looking 
at the penalty section that it is now a minimum fine 
of $500 up to $10,000. It used to be $50. When did 
that change? 

Mr. Gilleshammer: I believe that change was 
made in the legislation passed last year. 

Mr. Kowalski: Last year. That is it. 

Mr. Chairperson: Shall the March 3 1 ,  1993, 
Annual Report for the Manitoba Liquor Control 
Commission be passed-pass. 

The time is now 11 :38 a.m. What is the will of 
the committee? Committee rise. 

COMMITTEE ROSE AT: 1 1 :38 a.m. 


